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Email:  knowsley.ccgcommunications@knowsley.nhs.uk 
 
 
Freedom of Information Request 
 
We have a number of questions, which are as follows:  
 
Activity and waiting times  
 

1. Please confirm how many of the following diagnostic tests have been 
carried out in your area in each financial year since April 2013: (a) x-
ray; (b) ultrasound; (c) CT scan; (d) MRI scan; (e) gastroscopy; (f) 
colonoscopy; (g) flexible sigmoidoscopy; and (h) histopathology.  

 
 

Total tests 
carried out 2013-14 2014-15 2015-16 2016-17 

Colonoscopy 1,493 1,496 1,441 1,621 

Flexible 
sigmoidoscopy 982 1,047 1,362 1,436 

Gastroscopy 2,866 3,139 3,353 3,292 

Computed 
Tomography 18,158 22,191 23,381 24,587 

Magnetic Resonance 
Imaging 9,397 10,974 11,967 12,290 

Non-obstetric 
ultrasound 25,066 28,942 31,246 32,884 
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The CCG does not hold the information in relation to x-ray and histopathology 

 

  
2. Please confirm what the average waiting time in your CGG was for the 

following tests in each financial year since April 2013: (a) x-ray; (b) 
ultrasound; (c) CT scan; (d) MRI scan; (e) gastroscopy; (f) 
colonoscopy; (g) flexible sigmoidoscopy; and (h) histopathology. 
 

Median waiting time 
(wks) 2013-14 2014-15 2015-16 2016-17 

Colonoscopy 1.77 1.73 1.72 1.68 

Flexible 
sigmoidoscopy 1.65 1.65 1.63 1.46 

Gastroscopy 1.84 1.82 1.65 1.53 

Computed 
Tomography 1.09 1.25 1.21 1.34 

Magnetic Resonance 
Imaging 1.59 1.67 1.69 1.70 

Non-obstetric 
ultrasound 1.29 1.55 1.65 1.52 

 

  
The CCG does not hold the information in relation to x-ray and histopathology 

 
Funding  
 

3. Please confirm your CCG's budget allocation to fund imaging, 
pathology and endoscopy activity in each financial year since April 
2013, and what it is forecast to be in 2017/18.  
 

It is not possible to answer this question as costs will be allocated within PbR 
tariff prices or part of a block contract arrangements with providers. 

 
4. Please confirm whether your CCG received additional funding from the 

National Diagnostics Capacity Fund to increase capacity and 

productivity of diagnostic services. If so, how much.   
 
Knowsley CCG did not receive direct funding from the National Diagnostics 
Capacity Fund. 



 

Plans to invest and monitoring  
 

5. Please confirm how your CCG assesses anticipated changes in 
demand for (a) x-ray; (b) ultrasound; (c) CT scan; (d) MRI scan; (e) 
gastroscopy; (f) colonoscopy; (g) flexible sigmoidoscopy; and (h) 
histopathology, and what assessment it has made of projected 

changes in demand.   
 

The CCG would monitor demand on a monthly basis with Acute Trusts via the 
contract review meetings in collaboration with other local CCG’s. We plan 
diagnostic demand changes linked to screening and public information 
initiatives which could increase demand and would include these within 
planned activity assumptions with providers. 

 
6. Please confirm whether your CCG has plans to improve and expand 

diagnostic capacity in 2017/18 and, if so, what those plans are.  
 

The CCG has not specifically commissioned additional diagnostic capacity in 
2017/18. 

 
7. Please confirm how your CCG monitors capacity and performance for 

(a) x-ray; (b) ultrasound; (c) CT scan; (d) MRI scan; (e) gastroscopy; (f) 
colonoscopy; (g) flexible sigmoidoscopy; and (h) histopathology.  
 

This would be reviewed on a monthly basis at the contract review and any 
variation in performance affecting cancer targets would be reviewed on a 
service line basis. 
 

8. If diagnostic capacity has not been subject to increased investment, 
which of the 9 ‘must dos’ from the 2016/17 NHS England planning 
guidance have been prioritised?  
 

Knowsley CCG is focused on the delivery all of the ‘9 must dos’. 
 

Referral management centres  
 

9. Please confirm whether your CCG operates or commissions a referral 
management centre that assesses referrals by local GPs. 
 

The CCG Commissions a service which supports our ambition of improving 
Referral Quality. 

 
10. If yes to question nine, please confirm whether the list of specialities 

that fall under the referral management centre’s remit include 
suspected cancer cases.  

 
Referrals for suspected cancer (also known as two-week wait referrals) are 
not currently within the scope of the Referral Quality process. 
 


